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INTRODUCTION

The COVID-19 pandemic, which is caused by severe acute respiratory syndrome coronavirus 2
(SARS-CoV-2), is a public health emergency with high mortality and disability rates. Given its high
mortality rate, there is a serious need for possible effective medications to eliminate the virus, limit
the severity, and improve the prognosis (Altay et al., 2020). The management of COVID-19 has
continued to rely on drugs repurposed based on their pharmacological effects, including antiviral,
antibiotic, anti-inflammatory, and or immunomodulatory, along with availability of numerous
vaccines against SARS-CoV-2 in past few months (Fan et al., 2020). Repurposing of drugs has gained
enormous attention over identifying novel drug candidates, due to known safety, potency, and multi-
targeted pharmacological action as an immunomodulatory, anti-inflammatory, and antimicrobial
agent. Studies report that after fever, cough is one of the major symptoms in about 76% patients and
sputum production in 28% patients along with 55 and 44% of patients showing dyspnea andmyalgia,
respectively (Huang et al., 2020). In a study determined the prevalence of asymptomatic cases of
COVID-19 and characterized the symptoms of patients with mild COVID-19 report that of the 213
individuals with COVID-19, 19.2% were asymptomatic until admission (Kim et al., 2020). Among
the remaining patients with mild COVID-19, cough (40.1%) was the most common symptom
followed by hyposmia (39.5%) and sputum (39.5%). In individuals with hyposmia, 90% had
accompanying symptoms such as hypogeusia, nasal congestion or rhinorrhoea (Kim et al.,
2020). Sputum or productive cough seem a significant symptom in asymptomatic as well as
symptomatic (Kim et al., 2020). Cough was observed most common symptom followed by
hyposmia and sputum, while fever (>37.5°C) was only observed in 11.6% (Kim et al., 2020).
Another study reported that nasal congestion (62%) was the most common symptom in individuals
with mild COVID-19 (Chang et al., 2020).

The role of mucolytic and bronchodilator administration and tracheal suctioning have been
observed beneficial in airway hygiene by reducing the mortality rate of COVID-19 (Farooqi et al.,
2020). Therefore, the role of mucolytics, in particular, has been suggested to protect the body from
respiratory pathogens ascribed to their expectorant action, and are considered important as an
adjuvant in the management of COVID-19 (Esam, 2020). In the purview of the pharmacological
basis of therapeutics, we hypothesize that a proteolytic drug of natural origin, serratiopeptidase
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